BID FORM

2019 WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS

The undersigned declares that he/she has fully examined the Specification and other Contract
Documents as prepared by the Operations and Maintenance Department on file in the office of the
Director of Operations and Maintenance, all of which are fully understood and hereby agreed to. This is a
lump sum bid to include all chemicals listed below. The undersigned further understands that each item
may be awarded separately and that if the bid price is accepted, he/she is to furnish the materials as
specified previously and at the unit bid price until December 31, 2019. All bid prices shall be inclusive of
all applicable sales tax.

(Per Year) (Per Unit)

Hydrofluorosilicic Acid 5,000 gallons $2.09 /gal. $ 10,450.00
Chlorine

- One-ton cylinders 55 cylinders $481.00 /cyl. $ 26,455.00

— 150 Ibs. cylinders 65 cylinders $98.00 /cyl. $ 6.370.00
Polyphosphate 2500 gallons $6.10 /gal. $ 15,250.00
Zinc Orthophosphate 10,000 gallons $4.70 /gal. $ 47,000.00
Sulfur Dioxide

- 150 Ibs. cylinders 25 cylinders $134.50 /cyl. $ 3,362.50

- One-ton cylinders 15 cylinders $1,143.00 /eyl $ 17,145.00
Sulfuric Acid 40% 20,000 gallons $472 /gal. $ 94,400.00
Hawkins, Inc.
FIRM
2381 Rosegate
ADDRESS

Roseville, MN 55113

CITY/STATE/ZIP

Minnesota

STATE OF INCORPORATION
612-331-6910

TELEPHONE-NUMBER

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE

Thomas Keller, Vice President

TYPED/PRINTED NAME AND TITLE



BID FORM

2019 WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS

The undersigned declares that he/she has fully examined the Specification and other Contract Documents
as prepared by the Operations and Maintenance Department on file in the office of the Director of
Operations and Maintenance, all of which are fully understood and hereby agreed to. This is a lump sum
bid to include all chemicals listed below. The undersigned further understands that each item may be
awarded separately and that if the bid price is accepted, he/she is to furnish the materials as specified
previously and at the unit bid price until December 31, 2019. All bid prices shall be inclusive of all applicable

sales tax.
CHEMICAL e
(Per Year)
Hydrofluorosilicic Acid 5,000 gallons
Chlorine
— One-ton cylinders 55 cylinders
— 150 Ibs. cylinders 65 cylinders
Polyphosphate 2500 gallons
Zinc Orthophosphate 10,000 gallons
Sulfur Dioxide
- 150 Ibs. cylinders 25 cylinders
- One-ton cylinders 15 cylinders
Sulfuric Acid 40% 20,000 gallons

DPC Industries, Inc
FIRM

12800 Pine Bend Trail
ADDRESS

Rosemount MN 55068
CITY/STATE/ZIP

Delaware
STATE OF INCORPORATION

651.437.1333

David W. Schindeldecker
TYPED/PRINTED NAME AND TITLE

COST
(Per Unit)

2.28

507.00

130.00

6.65

4.93

135.00

1,170.00

/gal.

lcyl.
feyl.
/gal.
/gal.

leyl.
eyl
/gal.

TOTAL
COST

$ 11,400.00

$ 27,885.00
$ 8,450.00
$
$

__ 16625.00
49,300.00

$ 3,375.00
3 17,550.00

—c P TN

$ No Bid




BID FORM

2019 WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS

The undersigned declares that he/she has fully examined the Specification and other Contract
Documents as prepared by the Operations and Maintenance Department on file in the office of the
Director of Operations and Maintenance, all of which are fully understood and hereby agreed to. Thisis a
flump sum bid to include all chemicals listed below. The undersigned further understands that each item
may be awarded separately and that if the bid price is accepted, he/she is to furnish the materials as
specified previously and at the unit bid price until December 31, 2019. All bid prices shall be inclusive of
all applicable sales tax.

CHEMICAL %’Lm(——:T“”T%E COST %
(Per Year) (Per Unit)

Hydrofluorosilicic Acid 5,000 gallons /gal. $ NoBid
Chlorine

—  One-ton cylinders 55 cylinders /eyl. ¢ No Bid

~ 150 Ibs. cylinders 65 cylinders \ feyl. $ No Bid
Polyphosphate -~ 2500 gallons $12.37 /gal. $ 30,925.00
Zinc Orthophosphate 10,000 gallons $19.19 /gal. $ 191,900.00
Sulfur Dioxide

~ 150 Ibs. cylinders 25 cylinders fcyl. $ No Bid

- One-ton cylinders 15 cylinders feyl. $ No Bid
Sulfuric Acid 40% 20,000 gallons /gal. $ No Bid

Shannon Chemical Corporation
FIRM

P.O. Box 376

ADDRESS

Malvern, PA 19355
CITYISTATE/ZIP

Pennsylvania

STATE OF INCORPORATION
610-363-9090

TELEPHONE NUMBER .

1)C )1~

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE

Daniel C. Flynn, V.P.-Operations
TYPED/PRINTED NAME AND TITLE




